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In this work we investigate a syntactic change that can be seen as an effect of 
economy of movement, i.e., the way a V2 syntax is lost by progressively reducing 
the movement span of the inflected verb inside a split left periphery (Rizzi 1997, 
Benincà & Poletto 2004). The loss of V2 correlates with the rise of Infinitival 
Anteposition (IA) – the anteposition of infinitival forms (Inf) to modals (Mod), see 
(1) – across a series of Old Venetian (OVec) texts from the early XIV to the early 
XVI c. 
(1) se […] no entrometerà poi entrometere no porà 
 if not sue.FUT then sue.INF not can.FUT 
 ‘if […] they will not sue, they will not be able to sue.’ (Stat. Ven. 4, 19) 
The texts displaying the properties of a V2 grammar – V2 restriction, subject 
inversion, main/embedded asymmetry, enclisis to the finite verb (Benincà 2004) – 
show no cases of IA. The texts which do not display such properties allow for IA, 
with an increase toward the end of the period. The properties of IA are illuminating 
in explaining why this is so. With IA, only negative and impersonal clitics may 
intervene between Inf and Mod, so that Inf and Mod must be close. Additionally, 
the absence of main/embedded asymmetry and the order complementizers/ 
topic/focus > Inf indicate that Inf sits in the low extreme of the CP, possibly in a 
ground position. 
(2) [ForceP [TopP  [FocP [GroundP  far [FinP  debia [TP debia  … [vP  far ] … ] 
This explains the inverse correlation with V2. Suppose that XIII/early XIV c. OVen 
is a “Force-V2” language (very spare attestations of V3). In such a configuration, 
the inflected V would always bypass GroundP, the landing position of Inf in (2), 
accounting for the lack of IA. When V-to-Force is being lost, the reduced 
movement span of the inflected verb makes room for the surfacing of IA. This 
shows that the loss of V2 does not occur abruptly but in a stepwise fashion (Poletto 
1998) providing us with a window on how economy applies to language change. 
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